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This research deals with love in Arab critics as an authority 
on women, it was a love a world that we can tell him that a 
world parallel to the Arab reality, which reflected the 
dominance of men over women, and the world of love as 
demonstrated by us during the research world has women 
in it right leadership, it also world is based on the values 
and standards that run contrary to the values and 
community standards and perceptions, especially with 
regard to the link between men and women, we have seen 
that this has been achieved within the two sectors, 
launched on the first circle cancellation on the grounds that 
the revocation is the practices of power to subjugate and 
marginalize the other, were represented this constituency 
in the three axes are: the abolition of self and the abolition 
of the mind and the abolition of the body, the axes of 
dealing with the most enjoyed by men of symbolic capital 
in the Arab community, while the Second Circuit have 
launched by the Department of Prevention, has been the 
prevention practices of masculinity for men both in terms 
of privileges granted by the culture has to women, or what 
the nature of their relationship, and between abolition and 
prevention strategy exposed us to devote the speech 
Ashki authority counter for women against male authority 

enjoyed by the Arab culture.
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